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(d) The adjudicated... 

 We continue to reserve all rights. 

 Insurance Surety 

From: McGuire, Chris <Chris.McGuire@myfloridacfo.com> 
Sent: Thursday, July 11, 2024 6:25 AM 
To: 
 Subject: RE: [EXT] RE: Surety Bond - Bond #  

 [E!] Warning! This email originated outside of our organization. 
 [E!] Attention! Ce courriel provient de l'extérieur de notre organisation. 

Good Morning Curtis: 

Yes, it is our considered belief that the claim on Mr. Fredrics’ surety bond falls within the covered period. 
The claims check in question for $10,314.56 that was earmarked for the insured ( ), was dated 
August 18, 2016. It was then deposited into Mr. Fredrics’ bank account at Navy Federal Credit Union on 
September 16, 2016.  

From September 16, 2016 until present, the claims funds were never disbursed to     by Mr. Fredrics. 
Thus, the timeframe would suggest that the claim on the surety bond would fall under the attached bond for 
Mr. Fredrics with an effective date of 9/2/2015. The bond remained in effect for another 4 years until it was 
cancelled on September 2, 2019. 

Christopher McGuire, Regional Administrator  
Florida Department of Financial Services  
Division of Insurance Agent and Agency Services 

bfred
Typewritten Text
Exhibit #2

bfred
Typewritten Text

bfred
Typewritten Text

bfred
Typewritten Text
__________

bfred
Typewritten Text

bfred
Typewritten Text
<redacted>

bfred
Typewritten Text
<redacted>

bfred
Typewritten Text

bfred
Typewritten Text

bfred
Typewritten Text

bfred
Typewritten Text

bfred
Typewritten Text

bfred
Typewritten Text
<redacted>

bfred
Typewritten Text

bfred
Typewritten Text

bfred
Typewritten Text
<redacted>

bfred
Typewritten Text
<redacted>

bfred
Typewritten Text
<redacted>

bfred
Typewritten Text

bfred
Typewritten Text

bfred
Typewritten Text

bfred
Typewritten Text



4

 

From: McGuire, Chris <Chris.McGuire@myfloridacfo.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, July 9, 2024 2:27 PM 
To: 
Cc: Consumer Complaints  
Subject: [E!] - Surety Bond - Bond # 

 [E!] Warning! This email originated outside of our organization. 
 [E!] Attention! Ce courriel provient de l'extérieur de notre organisation. 

Good Afternoon Ms. : 

The Department kindly requests a claim be submitted on Mr. Bruce Fredrics surety bond (Bond #                         ). 

Case Background: Mr. Bruce Fredrics, in his capacity as a public adjuster, withheld claims proceeds in the 
amount of $10,314.56 belonging to the insured (                                     ). The Department has since revoked the 
license of Mr. Bruce Fredrics. 

The Department appreciates your assistance with this matter.  

Christopher McGuire, Regional Administrator  
Florida Department of Financial Services  
Division of Insurance Agent and Agency Services  
Bureau of Investigation 
Representing Chief Financial Officer Jimmy Patronis 
1400 West Commercial Boulevard, Suite 135  
Fort Lauderdale, FL 33309-3792 
Email: chris.mcguire@myfloridacfo.com 
Tel. 954-958-5535 

Subscribe to Weekly Rundown, CFO Patronis’ weekly newsletter  

External Email: Please do not click on links or attachments unless you know the content is safe. 
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EVERYBODY NEEDS TO SEE THIS!: This is a 100% FRAUD SCAM by Georgia (Yes, Georgia directs Florida! They are a team! Georgia is the Ring-Leader. This "Official-Legal" info was Affirmed false by a Judge in 2021!).

bfred
Typewritten Text

bfred
Typewritten Text

bfred
Typewritten Text

bfred
Typewritten Text

bfred
Typewritten Text

bfred
Typewritten Text

bfred
Typewritten Text

bfred
Typewritten Text

bfred
Typewritten Text

bfred
Typewritten Text

bfred
Typewritten Text

bfred
Typewritten Text

bfred
Typewritten Text

bfred
Typewritten Text

bfred
Typewritten Text
1) I was never a Public Adjuster!  I proved that 
    fact, and I prevailed - Judge Affirmed!
2) All claim money was never an issue. This 
    fact was fully validated in the Judicial Process  
    when I sued Florida, and "won" in 2021!
3) I have never had a REVOKED license, no 
    violations anywhere, ever! The TRUTH is polar 
    opposite. My career record is CLEAN over 50 
    years, of which these Corrupt Governments of 
    Georgia & Florida absolutely LOATH!, because 
    a) THEY are the Frauds! [I proved it (Caught!)]; 
    &, b) I had NO license for ANY penalty!; &, c) 
    BOTH LOST to me in 2021, I beat their Fraud!
    This is revenge/Cover-Up! = Organized Crime 
    Mafia! GA+FL Criminal poor-loser Officials!
    Crooks who attack law-abiding Americans.
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